International Journal of Innovative Research and Scientific Studies

— Back to Submissions

273 | Anggi Purnamasd et al. / Study of Factors Causing Landslide on Highways in Ogan Komering Ulu Regency, South Sumatra Provi  Library

Workflow Publication
Submission Review Copyediting Production
Submission Files Q Search
< 748 Study of Factors Causing Landslide on Highways in Ogan Komering Ulu December Article Text
Regency, South Sumatra Province .docx 17,2021
Download All Files
Pre-Review Discussions Add discussion
Name From Last Reply Replies Closed
» Study of Factors Causing Landslide on Highways in Ogan Komering anggipurnamasd - 0
Ulu Regency, South Sumatra Province 2022-01-07 01:21

AM



M Gmail

Editorial Decision: Article ID- IJIRSS/1211/21

12 pesan
International Journal of Innovative Research and Scientific Studies <info@ijirss.com>

Kepada: anggipurnama27@gmail.com
cc: yulindasari sutejo <yulindasari@unsri.ac.id>

Dear Anggi PURNAMA SARI DEWI
Congratulations!
International Journal of Innovative Research and Scientific Studies

ISSN-2617-6548

URL: http://www.ijirss.com/index.phplijirss

anggi purnama sari dewi <anggipurnama27@gmail.com>

29 Desember 2021 pukul 16.43

We are happy to let you know that your article “Study of Factors Causing Landslide on Highways in Ogan Komering Ulu Regency, South Sumatra Province" has been selected for publication in /nternational Journal of Innovative Research and Scientific Studies.
According to the journal's current policy, after acceptance the author will need to pay (USD 750 as an online publication fee+ USD 250 for proofreading_and English editing fee). Your article was evaluated in a blind review process by two referees in addition to the

input from the editor. Your article will be available online within 30 working days after receiving the Open Access Publication Fee.

Please pay the publication fee by clicking on that link:

URL:https://secure.2checkout.com/checkout/buy?merchant=102657919&tpl=default&prod=6&qty=1

Please remember to quote the manuscript number, [JIRSS/1211/21, whenever inquiring about your manuscript.

If you require further information, please do not hesitate to write me.

I look forward to hearing from you soon.

Thanks and best regards,

Natalie Jean

Editorial Manager

International Journal of Innovative Research and Scientific Studies
ISSN: 2617-6548

Scopus Link: https://www.scopus.com/sourceid/21101057630
URL:http://www.ijirss.com/index.phpl/ijirss

anggi purnama sari dewi <anggipurnama27@gmail.com>
Kepada: yulinda sari <yulindasarisutejo@gmail.com>

[Kutipan teks disembunyikan]

anggi purnama sari dewi <anggipurnama27@gmail.com>
Kepada: International Journal of Innovative Research and Scientific Studies <info@ijirss.com>, editor@ijirss.com

Hello,l have finished making the payment
[Kutipan teks disembunyikan]

@ Gmail - Your order on www.pakinsight.com_ Payment received.pdf
30K

International Journal of Innovative Research and Scientific Studies <info@jijirss.com>
Kepada: anggi purnama sari dewi <anggipurnama27@gmail.com>
cc: yulindasari sutejo <yulindasari@unsri.ac.id>

Dear Anggi PURNAMA SARI DEWI

Thanks for your email. I have received your payment proof. Now your paper is in the production process. Soon you will receive the final formatted copy for final proofreading.

If you require further information, please do not hesitate to write me.

With Best Regards,

Natalie Jean

Editorial Manager

International Journal of Innovative Research and Scientific Studies
ISSN: 2617-6548

Scopus Link: https://www.scopus.com/sourceid/21101057630
URL:http://www.ijirss.com/index.phpl/ijirss

[Kutipan teks disembunyikan]

anggi purnama sari dewi <anggipurnama27@gmail.com>
Kepada: yulinda sari <yulindasarisutejo@gmail.com>

[Kutipan teks disembunyikan]

anggi purnama sari dewi <anggipurnama27@gmail.com>
Kepada: yulinda sari <yulindasarisutejo@gmail.com>

[Kutipan teks disembunyikan]

anggi purnama sari dewi <anggipurnama27@gmail.com>
Kepada: maulidm.igbal@gmail.com

[Kutipan teks disembunyikan]

anggi purnama sari dewi <anggipurnama27@gmail.com>
Kepada: maulidm.igbal@gmail.com

---------- Forwarded message ---------

Dari: International Journal of Innovative Research and Scientific Studies <info@ijirss.com>
Date: Sel, 11 Jan 2022 pukul 17.28

Subject: Re: Editorial Decision: Article ID- [JIRSS/1211/21

[Kutipan teks disembunyikan]

[Kutipan teks disembunyikan]

anggi purnama sari dewi <anggipurnama27@gmail.com>
Kepada: International Journal of Innovative Research and Scientific Studies <info@ijirss.com>

Dear Natalie Jean,
hello, | have a question about when will my journal with number IJIRSS/1211/21 be published ?

thanks and best regards
[Kutipan teks disembunyikan]

International Journal of Innovative Research and Scientific Studies <info@ijirss.com>
Kepada: anggi purnama sari dewi <anggipurnama27@gmail.com>
cc: yulindasari sutejo <yulindasari@unsri.ac.id>

Thanks for the email. Your paper is under process of English Language proofreading. Thanks

Natalie Jean

Editorial Manager

International Journal of Innovative Research and Scientific Studies
ISSN: 2617-6548

Scopus Link: https://www.scopus.com/sourceid/21101057630
URL:http://www.ijirss.com/index.phpl/ijirss

[Kutipan teks disembunyikan]

anggi purnama sari dewi <anggipurnama27@gmail.com>
Kepada: International Journal of Innovative Research and Scientific Studies <info@jijirss.com>

Dear Natalie Jean,

hello, | have a question about when will my papper with number I[JIRSS/1211/21 be published ? | think after a month be published

thanks and best regards
[Kutipan teks disembunyikan]

International Journal of Innovative Research and Scientific Studies <info@ijirss.com>
Kepada: anggi purnama sari dewi <anggipurnama27@gmail.com>
cc: yulindasari sutejo <yulindasari@unsri.ac.id>

Dear Anggi PURNAMA SARI DEWI

Thanks for your email. We have sent your paper for English Language editing. We are waiting for the reply of our proofreader. Thanks

Natalie Jean

Editorial Manager

International Journal of Innovative Research and Scientific Studies
ISSN: 2617-6548

Scopus Link: https://www.scopus.com/sourceid/21101057630
URL:http://www.ijirss.com/index.phpl/ijirss

[Kutipan teks disembunyikan]

7 Januari 2022 pukul 19.39

10 Januari 2022 pukul 21.17

11 Januari 2022 pukul 17.28

11 Januari 2022 pukul 21.43

12 Januari 2022 pukul 07.41

12 Januari 2022 pukul 18.12

12 Januari 2022 pukul 18.13

16 Februari 2022 pukul 20.23

17 Februari 2022 pukul 11.21

2 Maret 2022 pukul 16.06

2 Maret 2022 pukul 16.26


http://www.ijirss.com/index.php/ijirss
https://secure.2checkout.com/checkout/buy?merchant=102657919&tpl=default&prod=6&qty=1
https://www.scopus.com/sourceid/21101057630
https://www.scopus.com/sourceid/21101057630
mailto:info@ijirss.com
https://www.scopus.com/sourceid/21101057630
https://www.scopus.com/sourceid/21101057630

M

Your order on www.pakinsight.com: Payment received
1 pesan

2Checkout Support <support@2checkout.com> Sen, 10 Jan 2022 pukul 15.45
Kepada: pengkisuanto@gmail.com

Pak Publishing Group 2checkout
http://www.pakinsight.com

Dear Pengki Suanto,

Thank you for your order on 2022-01-10 from http://www.pakinsight.com! We received your
1,000.00 USD payment (PayPal) for order 172169281.

The charge on your bank statement will appear as pakrdwcom*2Checkout. 2Checkout.com, Inc.
acts as an authorized payment service provider of Pak Publishing Group online products and

services.

Payment/Order information

Billing Information

Pengki Suanto

JI. Tanjung Air Perum Sriwijaya Hill Blok B No. 6, RT. 005 RW. 003 Kel. Bukit Baru Kec. llir Barat 1,
Palembang 30131, Indonesia

Ordered item(s) Unit Price Total
1 x Processing Fee 1,000.00 USD 1,000.00 USD
Sales Tax / VAT 0.00 USD

Grand Total 1,000.00 USD

You can access your products according to the terms and conditions you accepted during
purchase.

Support information

Need technical support? For product installation, activation and other technical support issues,
please contact Pak Publishing Group on +17542640197 or Conference@pakinsight.com

Need order support? Use myAccount to easily manage your order, subscription, invoice and
payment details. Signup / Login using your email address pengkisuanto@gmail.com


http://www.pakinsight.com/
http://www.2co.com/
http://www.pakinsight.com/
mailto:Conference@pakinsight.com
https://secure.2checkout.com/l.php?link=2l1m01vllxso%7C82692056
mailto:pengkisuanto@gmail.com

2Checkout has processed your order as the authorized payment service provider of Pak
Publishing Group.

Thank you,
The 2Checkout Team
WWW.2c0.com


http://www.2co.com/

