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Dear Viveka,

Please find attached 1) Bank remittance valued at USD 410 via BNI (Bank Negara
Indonesia), 2) Copyright transfer form for GJPAM paper 47050.
Looking forward the publication soon. Thank you.

Kind regards,
Herlina Hanum

On Friday, June 24, 2016 7:55 PM, Research India Publications <ripjournal@gmail.com> wrote:

Paper Accepted for GJPAM Paper Code: 47050

Dear Dr. Herlina Hanum,

Paper Code: 47050

We are very pleased to inform you that your paper "Modeling Gamma-Pareto
Distributed Data Using GLM Gamma" is accepted by our Editor-in-chief for
our journal Global Journal of Pure and Applied Mathematics (GJPAM).
Please find attached copyright transfer form. Publication is  $ 385.00 (US $
Three Hundred and  Eighty Five only).

Page charges include Publication charges, One Print Journal copy, PDF Copy and
free online access to journal issue. Please send us signed copy of copyright form
along with CHEQUE/DRAFT  in US$ PAYABLE TO "RESEARCH INDIA
PUBLICATIONS". You can also send payment by Credit Card.
If pay by bank transfer, please add extra US$ 30.00 for bank charges. Our bank
information is given below:

SWIFT CODE  -----CITIINBX     
Credit to  ------RESEARCH INDIA PUBLICATIONS
Account  No.-----0031384222
Name of Bank-----CITIBANK  N. A
Address     -----27, Central Market, West Punjabi Bagh, NEW DELHI-110026,
INDIA

Last date of submission of forms and publication charges is 05 July

mailto:ripjournal@gmail.com
mailto:ripjournal@gmail.com


2016.

Please inform us when you transfer payment to our account so that we can track
your payment.
Important Note: Please find attached library recommendation form. Please fill
up this form and send it to us as we will provide free journal copies to your
university library.

From the year 2016 GJPAM is open access journal so please circulate
information about GJPAM amongst your colleagues to encourage them to submit
manuscripts of full-length articles of considerable depth, for publication in
GJPAM. Kindly recommend GJPAM to your university library to manage
subscription order.

Thanking you and hope to hear from you soon,

With kind regards,

Viveka Nand
Publication Department
==============================
Research India Publications
B-2/84, Ground Floor, Rohini Sec-16
Delhi-110089 INDIA
Website: www.ripublication.com
Our Facebook page: https://www.facebook.com/ripublication
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Dear Viveka Nand,

Please find three files in Latex (tex, dvi and pdf) of our manuscript (GJPAM 47050). I hope the setting is

appropriate. Sorry for late answer of your request. Looking forward its publication soon.

Kindly regards,

Herlina Hanum (Mrs)

On Wednesday, July 6, 2016 7:25 PM, Research India Publications <ripjournal@gmail.com> wrote:

Dear Sir,

We would like to inform you that for mathematics journal you need to submit
your paper in latex format. other wise you have to make the payment $ 45 So,
that we will create your file in latex format.

With kind regards

Viveka Nand
Publication Department
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