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Mohamad Adam
Facalty of Economics
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Che ¥r Berbintang Pada Kamis, 18 Desamber 2018 17.28.17 WIB, JICG LICG Segitor fice123@gmail com> menulis: @
2 ® Ditunda
Spaces B> Terkirim Dear Mohamad Adam s
o O oraf 9 s my pleasure to inform you that, after the peer review, your paper, of Islamic P dbarnks and C: i Jndisnesia has been ACCEPTED to
Mast W ternatio: o of vation, Creativity g€, ‘our article will be ied . 1s5ue.
© ForTmo lish with Int nal Journal of Innor G and Change, [SSN: 2201 1315/E-ISSN: 2201-1323. Yk icle will be published in Apnil, 2020
Thete is a USD 700 publication fee for the article. The publication fee will include the followiag. +
Label + 1. Article process fee

Article formating fee that includes the figures and tables adjustment
Esspert Opinion, if required

Make it according to the jounal’s requirement

Reference comrection, if required

Translation of sentences i raquirad

o e b

I believe that our collaboration will help o accelerate the global knowledge cretion and shaving one step further. Intellectual Edge Consultancy SDN Bhd now waiting your aticle fec in order to process.

Please do not hesitate 1o contact me if you have any further questions.

Thanks
Loh wei-Lyn
Editorial Assistant
ional Joumsl ion, Creativi Change
ISSN:2201-1215/E-ISSN. 22011323
Scopus Indexation url htfo: i 18610

Intefleciual Edge Consultancy SOM Bnd
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On Mon, Dec 23, 2019 at 6:05 PM adam jordan =mr_adam?2406@yahoo com= wrote:
Dear,

Loh Wei-Lyn
Editorial Assistant
International Journal of Innovation, Creativity and Change

Hope you are doing well. Herewith, we would like lo deliver a proof of our payment { as a payment
reference INVOICE # [JICC_103.B_2019 ) (attached). Thank you very much for your kindness.

Mohamad Adam
Faculty of Economics
Sriwijaya University
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(i ¥r Berbintang
. Dear Adam
=1 Ditunda
Spaces B> Terkirim Please send us your final version paper.
n] [ Draf 9 Regards
Meet
v Selengkapnya Lok Wei-Lyn
Editorial Assistant
Label + International Journal of Innovation, Creativity and Change
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Scopus Indexation url: https://www.scopus com/sourceid/21100819610
Intellectual Edge Consultancy SDN Bhd
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Pada Sabtu, 28 Desember 2019 10.40.12 WIB, adam jordan <mr_adam2406@yahoo.com= menulis
ghat ¥r Berbintang
229 (® Ditunda Dear
Spaces B Terkirim Loh Wei-Lyn
Editorial Assistant
(|] D Draf 9 International Journal of Innovation, Creativity and Change
Meet

~  Selengkapnya
gkapny Hope you are well. Herewith we would like to deliver our final version article (attached). We hope our article

can be published in your journal ASAP. Thank you very much for your kindness.
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Best regards

Mohamad Adam
Faculty of Economics
Sriwijaya University
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On Tue, Jan 28, 2020 at 2:33 PM adam jordan <mr_adam2406@yahoo.com> wrote:
] & Kotak Masuk 369 Dear,
(Cheit ¥r Berbintang
Loh Wei-Lyn
09a @® Ditunda EdITOI’Ia! Assistant . N
g International Journal of Innovation, Creativity and Change
RACES B> Terkirim
e D Draf 9 Hope you are doing well. Please inform us if our article payment has been received by you
reference INVOICE # IJICC_103.B_2019 ) (attached). Thank you very much for your kindn
et v~ Selengkapnya
Mohamad Adam
Faculty of Economics
Label + Sriwijaya University
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(] E Kotak Masuk 369 Dari: UICC ICC <editorijicct23@gmail.com>
Chat k Kepada: adam jordan <mr_adam2406@yahoo.com>
Yr Berbintang Terkirim: Selasa, 28 Januari 2020 20.35 14 WIS
28 @ Ditunda Judul: Re: Acceptance letter
=
S B> Terkirim Dear Adam
Cx O praf K We have received your payment and your paper is in the process of publication.
Meet v Selengkapnya
Regards
Label + Loh Wei-Lyn
Editorial Assistant
International Jeurnal of Innavation, Creativity and Change
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