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Re: Paper Submission
editorial-office@jonuns.com <editorial-office@jonuns.com> 27 Oktober 2021 pukul 20.00
Kepada: isnainimawardi22@gmail.com

Dear Authors,
We hope our e-mail finds you well. Welcome to the Journal of Hunan University Natural Sciences!
Thank you for contacting our Editorial Board Members.
We have received the reports from expert reviewers on your manuscript. Your paper has been reviewed and was accepted for publication in the Journal of Hunan University
Natural Sciences, Volume 48 (11), 2021, with the below list of minor necessary corrections.
If you want to publish in Journal of Hunan University Natural Sciences, Volume 48, Issue 11, November 2021, you need to send the following to the editorial office via editorial-
office@jonuns.com (all in one archive):

1. The article, strictly formatted according to the template recommendations for authors and correct the article on the reviewers' recommendations, see
http://jonuns.com/docs/template.doc .
2. Payment foto.

Please highlight the corrections in the article in red. We hope you'll do great.
First, we would like to congratulate the authors for their work. The authors present an interesting topic.
Secondly, we would like to make some comments on the reviewes of the paper:
1. Please add research scientific novelty (one-two sentence) in the abstract.
2. Please retain only the most recent references, preferably those published in 2016-2021. List of references must be reduced to a maximum of 30 sources.
3. Please describe scientific novelty (200-250 words) in the conclusion.
4. Please describe the limitations of the study, and the research perspectives in the conclusion.
5. The article needs English editing.
Deadline for corrections and payment: November 7, 2021.
Please find attached the invoice.
*Please include the invoice number in the payment note.
**Please write in the e-mail subject: Revised article and payment proof.

All articles published in are published in full open access. In order to provide free access to readers, and to cover the costs of peer review, copyediting, typesetting, long-term
archiving, and journal management, an article processing charge (APC) of EUR 400 applies to papers accepted after peer review.
We recommend that the authors use the academic text editing service for the scientific articles, not just proofreading. Please use the American English option. We recommend
the use of large, trusted companies with editors having a Ph.D. degree. You should also attach an editing certificate or use the editorial office services. Articles that native
English speakers do not edit are not allowed for publication. The editorial team provides English academic proofreading services for the authors at an additional cost. The fee -
EUR 50.00 was already included in the invoice because the certificate of English proofreading is not attached to the article.
The total fee is EUR 450.00, including English editing.
Payment in EURO must be made by wire transfer to the bank account. Banks fees must be paid by the customer for both payer and payee so that we can receive the full
invoiced amount.
Volume 48 (11), 2021 will be published online during November.
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Thank you very much for your support of open access publishing.
If you have any questions, please do not hesitate to contact us via editorial-office@jonuns.com.
Have a nice day.
Take care of yourself!

Yours sincerely,
Editor-in-Chief
魏建义 Prof. Yi Weijian
Journal of Hunan University Natural Science
http://jonuns.com/index.php/journal

-------- Original Message --------
Subject: Paper Submission
Date: 2021-10-11 15:10
From: Journal of Hunan University Natural Sciences <office@jonuns.com>
To: editorial-office@jonuns.com

Title of your paper: Functional Correlation of Seagrass Meadows and Ichthyofauna in the Coastal Waters of the Lampung Bay, Indonesia
Corresponding Author's Email Address: isnainimawardi22@gmail.com
Author(s): Isnaini, Dietriech Geoffrey Bengen, Tri Prartono, Zainal Arifin
Keywords: Density of meadow, class size of ichthyofauna, Bay of Lampung
Abstract: Fish take advantage of seagrass meadows in different ways, and in general, fish use them as a feeding ground, raising ground and hiding shelter from predators, and
therefore, the association of seagrass and related organisms is established. This study was intended to analyze the contribution of the seagrass ecosystem to ichthyofauna in
the Bay of Lampung waters. The study was performed from October 2018 to March 2019 in the Bay of Lampung, Lampung Province. The study stations consist of 8 different
stations, which were determined by purposive sampling. The data collection regarding seagrass density was using the quadrate transect method, and the sample collection of
ichthyofauna was conducted with gill nets. The correlation of seagrass density with the classes of ichthyofauna sizes and the correlation of the trophic levels with the classes of
ichthyofauna sizes use Correspondence Analysis (CA). The study results show that the trophic groups of ichthyofauna species are dominated mainly by the trophic group of the
carnivore, followed by omnivore, as the least trophic group herbivore. The results of the correspondence analysis show the correlation of the seagrass density with the
ichthyofauna's length. In contrast, the large-size ichthyofauna prefers the seagrass meadows with a high-density level, as the small-size ichthyofauna prefer the seagrass
meadows with a low level of density. The correlation of seagrass density with the trophic group shows that the herbivore trophic group's ichthyofauna has smaller sizes than the
carnivore and omnivore ichthyofauna.
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Kepada: editorial-office@jonuns.com

Dear Editor,
Thank you, my paper has been accepted for publication in the journal of Hunan University Natural Sciences, Volume 48 (11), 2021. Revised article and payment of the
publication fee has been completed.
* revised article and transfer receipt attached

That's all I can say, thank you for your cooperation

Best regards,

Isnaini
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Kepada: isnainimawardi22@gmail.com

Dear Isnaini, We apologize for the late reply.

Thank you for your revision and payment. We have received everything. We are satisfied with the revisions of the article.
Your article will be published in the next four to seven weeks in Volume 48 (11), 2021.

Thank you in advance for your cooperation.

Kind regards,
Yang Chaowei
Assistant Editor
e-mail: editorial-office@jonuns.com

Disclaimer: Journal of Hunan University Natural Sciences recognizes the importance of data privacy and protection. We treat personal data in line with the General Data
Protection Regulation (GDPR) and with what the community expects of us. The information contained in this message is confidential and intended solely for the use of the
individual or entity to whom they are addressed. If you have received this message in error, please notify me and delete this message from your system. You may not copy this
message in its entirety or in part, or disclose its contents to anyone.
[Kutipan teks disembunyikan]

2 lampiran

Tranfer receipt publication fee_invoice P 102.jpeg
166K

Manuscript full_Isnaini.docx
283K

7/11/25, 6:41 AM Gmail - Revised article and payment proff

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=dff96b52a3&view=pt&search=all&permmsgid=msg-f:1715854168530463853&simpl=msg-f:1715854168530463853 1/1

mailto:editorial-office@jonuns.com
https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ui=2&ik=dff96b52a3&view=att&th=17cff04679a1ac6d&attid=0.2&disp=inline&safe=1&zw
https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ui=2&ik=dff96b52a3&view=att&th=17cff04679a1ac6d&attid=0.2&disp=inline&safe=1&zw
https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ui=2&ik=dff96b52a3&view=att&th=17cff04679a1ac6d&attid=0.1&disp=attd&safe=1&zw
https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ui=2&ik=dff96b52a3&view=att&th=17cff04679a1ac6d&attid=0.1&disp=attd&safe=1&zw

